
 
PROFILE OF Mr SUNIL KUMAR R 

Speaker – Trainer – Author – Designer - Consultant  
 
A graduate of Commerce & a Graduate of Law from Osmania University, Sunil 
took up further studies in Masters Degree of LAW. He had a brilliant academic 
career and has been a keen learner, all through. His active role in Business; 
Industry and Social arena got him work with several national and global teams 
and actively associate in delivery of major assignments. 
 
Sunil’s Training comes from his leadership expertise and the massive 
productivity, which is the result of his powerful designs; strategic approaches to 
inter-personal relations as well as his business and industry leadership.  
 
For over 30 years, Sunil’s role as a Speaker; Trainer, Author and Consultant has 
witnessed unparalleled success levels in all that he embarked upon.  With a 
business background of Travel & Tourism; Advertising & Marketing and 
Construction, his diversified activity has been a huge support in vision building 
and management consultancy. 
 
He has interacted with several learning groups that included Senior Level 
Executives of large and medium corporates – Sales & Marketing Executives – 
Teachers & Students – organizational heads – business leaders & Professionals 
– and other officials.  A specialist Faculty Development (Train-the-Trainer) 
Coach, Mr Sunil has been instrumental in offering comprehensive training to 
impart effective learning to Trainers & Teachers.  
 
Some hi-lights of Sunil’s training is of great value to the teams he gets associated 
with as he continuously and consistently coaches various groups across the 
world.  

•  

• Sunil is a qualified International Trainer, he is first Indian and second Asian to 
be conferred “International Training Fellow” award from JCI, USA and a Head 
Coach for the top level Global Train the Trainer Program. Sunil is also 
presented the Lions Certified Instructor, a global acknowledgement by Lions 
International. 

 

• His specialty in training includes program and curriculum designing and 
delivery of life-changing modules in the areas of Leadership; Change 
Management; Interpersonal Relations; Innovation management; and other 
skills that are required to sustain and grow in this challenging environment. 
He is an excellent consultant trainer to corporates seeking solutions to keep 
their personnel inspire and on the mode to upgrade and retain relevance. 
 



• Sunil has conducted 1,600 training programs in 18 countries. His 5 day life-
changing programs have had a huge impact on thousands of entrepreneurs 
and professionals  

 

• He has large alumni of over 600 trainers, who have been coached by him in 
his core program “Train the Trainer”. 
 

Other key aspects of Mr Sunil Kumar  
 

Sunil served on several national and international boards. He had led large sized 
organizations from the front and helped accomplish success levels that are 
historic and far reaching.  
 
He has been the National President of Indian Jaycees and continued to offer 
leadership in the Global Scenario having served as the World Vice President and 
World Executive Vice President. 
 
He has served Lions Clubs International (LCI) as the District Governor and 
thereafter was elected to the International Board of LCI, where he served as the 
International Director for 2 years.  
 
He served as the Chairman of the most important International District Governor 
Elect Seminar, which was held at Chicago during June/July 2017. The program 
trained about 740 District Governors Elect, from all over the world in 13 
Languages, spreads over 4 days. Their spouses too were involved into training.  
 
Sunil served as the National President of Travel Agents Association of India, for 
a record period of 6 years (2014-2019).  TAAI is a premier and nodal Travel & 
Tourism Association of the Country, which is the largest and oldest and with over 
2,400 companies as its members.  
 
Sunil currently serves as the Global President of UFTAA - United Federation of 
Travel Agents Associations, for the Sixth year. UFTAA is a global federation that 
has national travel associations across the world as its members. The 
Association fosters travel and tourism as well as education. 
 
A highly established Conference organizer, Sunil has to his credit the 
chairmanship of several large national and international conferences, which were 
delivered with high standards and great value.  
 
Sunil authored and led publication of several books for his programs including 
Broadband your Benchmarks; Best and Beyond; Success … No matter what; 
Unlocking Uncertainties; Paradox of Possibilities and more. He published 
Meeting Specialist, which hi-lights Parliamentary Procedures for societies 

 



His recent and most innovative publication “Where’s my Couch? Is on its 
journey to gain popularity.  
 
He has been the editor of Lion India Magazine with a circulation of about 200,000 
issues, monthly. He has also led the publishing of the popular travel and tourism 
magazine – NAMASTAAI from TAAI. 

 
Sunil’s greatest excitement is to keep discovering. He has visited 89 countries 
and his quest to travel and visit new places continues. 
 
Sunil lives in Hyderabad. 
 
 
 
 

  
 


